
EAGLE 

Robert B. 'Bruce� 

Gordon 

Nov. 2, 1957 - Nov. 2, 1957 

Robert B. "Bruce" Gordon 
of Eagle died ThursdaY, 
April 26, 2012, at Waukesha 
Memorial Hospital at the age 
of 54. He was born in 
Wausau on Nov. 2, 1957, the 
son of Robert M. and Effie 
M. (nee Kivela) Gordon.

Bruce enjoyed camping
and the outdoors. 

He is survived by his 
brother, James Andrew Gor­
don; nephews, John Gordon 
and Richard Messier; great­
nieces, Gina, Arielle and 
Ashley; great-nephew, Rick; 
and his uncle, Harry Gordon. 
He will be missed by all his 
friends, especially his special 
friends Mike and Carrie 
Stewart. 

He was preceded in death 
by his parents and sister, 
Shelly Dunn Boyer. 

Private family services will 
be held. 

For further information, 
please call Randle-Dable­
Brisk Funeral, Cremation 
and Preplanning Services at 
547-4035 or go to www:wauke­
shafunerals.com to leave the
family an online tribute mes­
sage.

(Freeman - May I. 2012) 
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